
TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED ON Wednesday,  February 22 @ 3:00

ITEM
 NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

1

Provide mobilization, 
demobilization, bonding, insurance, 
erosion control (including all work 
necessary for a complete SWPPP), 
traffic control, asbuilts, compliance 
with the general conditions and 
permit conditions and any other 
work for which a specific bid item is 
not provided.

1 LS $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $78,455.50 $78,455.50 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $69,000.00 $69,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $62,000.00 $62,000.00

Removal Items:

2
Sawcut, remove and dispose of 
existing AC Pavement.

3,325 SF $4.00 $13,300.00 $5.11 $16,990.75 $5.00 $16,625.00 $4.00 $13,300.00 $3.50 $11,637.50 $4.50 $14,962.50

3
Sawcut, remove and dispose of 
existing PCC Sidewalk to nearest 

550 SF $7.00 $3,850.00 $5.86 $3,223.00 $23.00 $12,650.00 $12.00 $6,600.00 $8.00 $4,400.00 $3.25 $1,787.50

4
Sawcut, remove and dispose of 
existing PCC curb and gutter to 
nearest joint.

150 LF $10.00 $1,500.00 $22.88 $3,432.00 $33.00 $4,950.00 $32.00 $4,800.00 $24.00 $3,600.00 $11.00 $1,650.00

5
Remove and dispose of existing 15‐
inch storm drain.

75 LF $35.00 $2,625.00 $48.27 $3,620.25 $20.00 $1,500.00 $111.00 $8,325.00 $49.00 $3,675.00 $26.00 $1,950.00

6

Remove and replace 8‐inch PVC 
waterline per Details G‐1 and G‐2 
on Sheet C6 and waterline 
protection at vertical crossing.

25 LF $700.00 $17,500.00 $640.00 $16,000.00 $800.00 $20,000.00 $727.00 $18,175.00 $1,135.00 $28,375.00 $1,143.00 $28,575.00

7

Remove and relocate existing water 
service lateral and salvage existing 
meter. Abandon existing lateral at 
main as necessary. Install new 1‐
inch service line from main to 
salvaged meter.

3 EA $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,821.67 $8,465.01 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,300.00 $9,900.00 $3,650.00 $10,950.00 $3,332.00 $9,996.00

8

Coordinate relocation of 
approximately 10‐LF of 2‐inch gas 
main with SW Gas. Contractor to 
provide exaction, bedding, and 
backfill. Mainline will be relocated 
by SW Gas at no additional cost to 
the Town or Contractor.

1 LS $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $4,305.00 $4,305.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,900.00 $5,900.00 $6,550.00 $6,550.00 $15,353.00 $15,353.00
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9
Reroute 2‐inch comm conduit 
above existing storm drain as shown 
on Sheet C5 of approved plans. 

1 LS $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $3,345.00 $3,345.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,200.00 $3,200.00 $6,370.00 $6,370.00 $1,700.00 $1,700.00

Base Bid Construction Items:

10

Furnish and install 5‐foot wide 20‐
foot long PCC driveway per detail 
A08‐A on Sheet C6 including 5‐foot 
driveway wings and curb and 

1 EA $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,395.00 $7,395.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $10,250.00 $10,250.00 $7,100.00 $7,100.00

11
Furnish and install PCC curb and 
gutter to nearest joint per Detail 
A05‐A on Sheet C6.

110 LF $60.00 $6,600.00 $70.82 $7,790.20 $40.00 $4,400.00 $72.00 $7,920.00 $95.00 $10,450.00 $129.00 $14,190.00

12
Furnish and install PCC sidewalk per 
Detail A06 on Sheet C6.

400 SF $20.00 $8,000.00 $26.18 $10,472.00 $20.00 $8,000.00 $19.00 $7,600.00 $22.00 $8,800.00 $19.00 $7,600.00

13
Furnish and install 4‐inch thick AC 
Pavement per Detail D01 on Sheet 

3,325 SF $8.00 $26,600.00 $12.93 $42,992.25 $16.00 $53,200.00 $8.00 $26,600.00 $13.50 $44,887.50 $17.00 $56,525.00

14
Furnish and install 60” – 72” storm 
drain manhole per Detail on Sheet 

5 EA $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $8,320.00 $41,600.00 $11,200.00 $56,000.00 $13,500.00 $67,500.00 $13,750.00 $68,750.00 $10,500.00 $52,500.00

15
Cap existing storm drain line per 
detail on Sheet C7.

3 EA $2,500.00 $7,500.00 $2,840.00 $8,520.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $2,900.00 $8,700.00 $3,380.00 $10,140.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00

16
Furnish and install Type 4R curb 
inlet per Detail D06 on Sheet C7.

1 EA $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,670.00 $3,670.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $6,900.00 $6,900.00 $5,557.00 $5,557.00

17

Furnish and Install 60‐inch Storm 
Drain Manhole per 60‐inch storm 
drain manhole detail on Sheet C7 
and Electrical Plans. Install Town 
furnished sump pump.

1 EA $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $23,890.00 $23,890.00 $41,500.00 $41,500.00 $48,000.00 $48,000.00 $43,500.00 $43,500.00 $43,500.00 $43,500.00

18
Furnish and install 48‐inch storm 
drain manhole per Detail D04 and 
D07 on Sheet C7.

1 EA $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,620.00 $7,620.00 $12,825.00 $12,825.00 $10,200.00 $10,200.00 $8,745.00 $8,745.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

19

Furnish and install 48‐inch sewer 
manhole with eccentric lid per 
detail on Sheet C4 with 
approximately 40 LF of 8‐inch SDR‐
35 sewer line. Cap at property line 
behind driveway. Slope 2%. 

1 EA $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $11,490.00 $11,490.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $12,900.00 $12,900.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00
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20

Furnish and install 8‐inch tee with 
three gate valves per Detail G‐7 on 
Sheet C8 and approximately 33 LF 
of 8‐inch PVC Waterline. Install cap 
at property line behind driveway.

1 EA $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $17,580.00 $17,580.00 $33,750.00 $33,750.00 $31,500.00 $31,500.00 $29,500.00 $29,500.00 $35,500.00 $35,500.00

21
Furnish and install Flared End 
Section per Detail on Sheet C7.

2 EA $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,115.00 $6,230.00 $1,300.00 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 $5,800.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,600.00 $3,200.00

22
Furnish and install Class 300 Rip Rap 
per SSPWC 200.07 (no bedding)

680 SF $15.00 $10,200.00 $8.45 $5,746.00 $12.50 $8,500.00 $8.00 $5,440.00 $11.00 $7,480.00 $6.00 $4,080.00

Electric Items:

23

Furnish and install conduit and 
conductors and install Town 
furnished pump controller per 
Sheets E1 to E4 of the electrical 

1 LS $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $14,720.00 $14,720.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $11,300.00 $11,300.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00

24

Furnish and install 3‐foot by 3.5‐
foot by 6‐inch thick PCC concrete 
collar on 8‐inches of aggregate base 
compacted per plans.

1 LS $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,720.00 $1,720.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,700.00 $2,700.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

25

Furnish and install all conduit, 
conductors, and pull boxes and any 
other work necessary for complete 
electrical start up.

1 LS $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $9,490.00 $9,490.00 $8,100.00 $8,100.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00

Testing Items:

26
Test Pumps per Section 14.02 of the 
project Specifications 

1 LS $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,620.00 $3,620.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

Total Base Bid: $335,175.00 $362,381.96 $419,600.00 $412,060.00 $447,610.00 $437,326.00

Pipe Option No. 1

a27

Furnish and install dual 15‐inch 
RGRCP storm drain pipes with 1‐
foot min separation with bedding 
and backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7

570 LF $400.00 $228,000.00 No Bid No Bid $398.00 $226,860.00 $276.00 $157,320.00 $281.00 $160,170.00
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A28

Furnish and install 30‐inch RGRCP 
storm drain pipes with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7.

25 LF $500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid No Bid $1,175.00 $29,375.00 $1,475.00 $36,875.00 $477.00 $11,925.00

A29

Furnish and install 24‐inch RGRCP 
storm drain pipe with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7

35 LF $400.00 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid $418.00 $14,630.00 $280.00 $9,800.00 $293.00 $10,255.00

A30

Furnish and install 15‐inch RGRCP 
storm drain pipe with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7.

15 LF $200.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid $662.00 $9,930.00 $183.00 $2,745.00 $194.00 $2,910.00

Total Pipe Option One: $257,500.00 No Bid No Bid $280,795.00 $206,740.00 $185,260.00

Total Base Bid + Pipe Option One: $596,100.00 No Bid No Bid $692,825.00 $654,350.00 $622,586.00

Pipe Option No. 2

b27

Furnish and install dual 15‐inch 
HDPE storm drain pipes with 1‐foot 
min separation with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7

570 LF $300.00 $171,000.00 $195.85 $111,634.50 $193.00 $110,010.00 $238.00 $135,660.00 $176.00 $100,320.00 $232.00 $132,240.00

b28

Furnish and install 30‐inch HDPE 
storm drain pipes with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7

25 LF $325.00 $8,125.00 $432.20 $10,805.00 $431.00 $10,775.00 $314.00 $7,850.00 $800.00 $20,000.00 $254.00 $6,350.00

b29

Furnish and install 24‐inch HDPE 
storm drain pipe with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7.

35 LF $230.00 $8,050.00 $254.57 $8,909.95 $200.00 $7,000.00 $218.00 $7,630.00 $216.00 $7,560.00 $185.00 $6,475.00

b30

Furnish and install 15‐inch HDPE 
storm drain pipe with bedding and 
backfill per typical storm drain 
trench detail DO1‐A on Sheet C7.

15 LF $180.00 $2,700.00 $284.67 $4,270.05 $120.00 $1,800.00 $354.00 $5,310.00 $150.00 $2,250.00 $155.00 $2,325.00

Total Pipe Option Two: $189,875.00 $135,619.50 $129,585.00 $156,450.00 $130,130.00 $147,390.00

Total Base Bid + Pipe Option Two: $525,050.00 $498,001.46 $549,185.00 $568,510.00 $577,740.00 $584,716.00



TABULATION OF BIDS RECEIVED ON Wednesday,  February 22 @ 3:00

ITEM
 NO. DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

West Coast Paving MKD Construction

Town of Gardnerville
Gardnerville, Nevada

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE

PROJECT NO. 2001 PWP DO-2022-385

Gardnerville Station Oulet Piping

Cutting Edge Construction LLC Four Point Engineering ARMAC Constriction LLC

ADDITIONAL BIDDERS

Base Pipe Option 1 Base + Option 
1 Pipe Option 2 Base +   Option 

2
6 Colbre Grading and Paving $285,355.00 $650,786.75 $241,435.00 $606,866.75
7 FW Carson Company $211,520.00 $688,000.00 $155,965.00 $632,445.00
8 Burdick Excavating Company $348,540.00 $825,075.00 $239,000.00 $715,635.00
9 Resource Development CO $252,075.00 $823,105.00 $176,750.00 $747,080.00

$365,431.75
$476,480.00
$476,535.00
$570,330.00


